
HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE 
Bid Opening: Monday, March 18, 2024 – 10:30 a.m. 

FOR 
Annual Physical Inspection of 2,216 Housing Units,  

Administration Buildings & Centers 
 

Contractor 
 

Bid Amount Affidavit Remarks 

U. S. Inspection Group, Inc. 
Ken Pilbin, President  
P. O. Box 2838 
Crossville, TN  38557 
PH      866-863-8744 
FAX   866-573-3280 
jemery@usinspectiongroup.com 
 
 
     AWARDED 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

$12.90/Unit = $28,573.50 
Harbor Homes-$5,495.40 
Lake City Dwellings-$4,231.20 
John E. Horan Garden 
Apartments-$6,269.40 
Agnes Priscaro/Pineview & 
Scattered-$1,844.70 
Schmid Towers-$2,489.70 
Friendship Apts.-$2,580.00 
Ostrow Apts. & Central 
Maintenance-$1,032.00 
Erie Heights-$2,709.00 
C. Ted Dombrowski-$438.60 
Curry Schell Apts.-$812.70 
Better Housing Old-$154.80 
Better Housing East-$258.00 
Better Housing West-$258.00 
 
 
 

 
  Yes 

 
ECS Services LLC - Insurance 

Nonprofit Development Corporation 
Christopher Lunn 
clunn@anrinfo.org 
724-504-6892 

 
    NO BID 

  

American Property Consultants, Inc. 
Misty Behnke, apcmisty@comcast.net  
410-586-1963 

 
   NO BID 

  

    
Deltek 
sourcemgmt@onvia.net  

   NO BID   
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Contractor 
 

 
Bid Amount 

 
Affidavit 

 
Remarks 

    
Construct Connect 
Mogan Stinson 
Content@costructconnect.com 
800-364-2059 

 
   NO BID 

  

Onvia 
Sourcemanagement2@onvia.com 
 

 
   NO BID 

  

Bidnet 
Kurt Pitzer 
gbs@bidnet.com 
800-677-1997 

 
   NO BID 

  

PWXPress 
Mary Miller 
bids@pwxpress.com 

 
   NO BID 
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