
HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE 
Bid Opening: December 11, 2023 – 10:30 a.m. 

FOR 
Floor Replacement at HACE Apartment Buildings 

 
Contractor 
 

2024 Bid Amount /  
Unit Cost Per Sq. Ft. 

2025 Bid Amount /  
Unit Cost Per Sq. Ft. 
 

Affid
avit 

Bid 
Submission 
Remarks 

El and K Unlimited LLC 
Leesa Buck 
elandkunlimited@yahoo.com 
814-384-7278 

Ostrow & Curry Schell - Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $21.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $11.00/sq. ft. 
Occupied: Same 
Schmid and Friendship – Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $21.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $11.00/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 

Ostrow & Curry Schell - Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $22.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $12.00/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 
Schmid and Friendship – Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $22.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $12.00/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 

 
 
Yes 

Addendum 
Acknowledged 

Konkol Construction LLC 
Randy Konkol 
konkolconstruction@yahoo.com 
814-450-5846 
 
          AWARDED 

Ostrow & Curry Schell - Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $16.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $6.00/sq. ft. 
Occupied: Same 
Schmid and Friendship – Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $17.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $7.25/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 

Ostrow & Curry Schell - Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $17.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $7.00/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 
Schmid and Friendship – Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $18.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $8.25/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 

 
 
Yes 

 
Addendum  
Acknowledged 

TIP Construction Inc. 
Ilya Pribyshchuk 
ilyaptip@gmail.com 
814-504-4978 

 
   NO BID 

   

PalermoEX.Inc. 
Vincent Palermo 
vpalermo@palermoex.com 
814-572-6042 

Ostrow & Curry Schell - Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $17.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $7.50/sq. ft. 
Occupied: Same 
Schmid and Friendship – Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $17.75/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $8.25/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 

Ostrow & Curry Schell - Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $17.25/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $7.50/sq. ft. 
Occupied: Concrete - $17.50/sq.ft. 
                  Planking - $ 7.50/sq. ft. 
Schmid and Friendship – Vacant 
Bathroom on Concrete $18.00/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $8.25/sq. ft. 
Occupied:  Same 
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PWXPress 
Mary Miller 
bids@pwxpress.com  

 
   NO BID 

   

ConstructConnect 
Therin E. Bliss 
Therin.bliss@constructconnect.com  

 
   NO BID 

   

Dodge 
Jayaiakshmi 
s.kalyanaraman@construction.com 
 

 
   NO BID 

   

Onvia 
Source Management 
deltekplusonvia@gmail.com  

 
   NO BID 

   

Source Management 
deltekplusonvia@gmail.com 

    NO BID    

Dodge Data & Analytics 
Adam Bouman 
Dodge.bidding@construction.com 

 
   NO BID 

   

Builders Exchange 
Amy Stewart 
astewart@bxohio.com 

 
   NO BID 

   

Prime Vendor Inc. 
Primendor123@gmail.com 
910-805-9030 

 
   NO BID 
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