
HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE 
Bid Opening: November 13, 2023 – 10:30 a.m. 

FOR 
Floor Replacement at Various Locations 

 
Contractor 
 

2024 Bid Amount /  
Unit Cost Per Sq. Ft. 

2025 Bid Amount /  
Unit Cost Per Sq. Ft. 
 

Affi
davi
t 

Bid Submission & 
all items submitted 
& Remarks 

     
Konkol Construction 
814-450-5846 
Contact: Randy Konkol 
konkolconstruction@yahoo.com 
 
          AWARDED 

Bath $26/sq. ft. 
Bath on concrete $18/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile $6/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile on concrete $5/sq.ft. 
Planking Floor $10/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $8/sq. ft. 
Occupied Units:  Same 

Bath $27/sq. ft. 
Bath on concrete $19/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile Floor $6.50/sq.ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $5.50/sq.ft. 
Planking Floor $11/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $9/sq.ft. 
Occupied Units: Same 

Yes Checklist included 
Addendum 
Acknowledged 

Hoffman United, LLC 
814-969-3553 
Contact: Paul Hoffman 
Paul.hoffman@hoffmanunited.com  

 
   NO BID 

   

Rules Construction LLC   
MelihaKahrimanovic      
Rulesconstruction@yahoo.com 
814-384-9691 

 
  NO BID 

   

Bovkun’s Building Solutions LLC 
Vitally Bovkun 
bovkunv@gmail.com 
814-860-6415 

 
  NO BID 

   

Bauer Ventures 
Matthew Bauer 
matthewbauer@roadrunner.com 
814-434-2505 

 
  NO BID 

   

EL and K Unlimited LLC 
Eric Buck 
elandkunlimited@yahoo.com 

Bath $28/sq. ft. 
Bath on concrete $20/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Floor $10/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on concrete $8/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $12/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $10/sq. ft. 
 

Bath $29/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $21/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Floor $11.60/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $10/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $13/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $12/sq. ft. 
 

Yes Checklist included 
Addendum 
Acknowledged 
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Occupied Units: 
Bath $58/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $50/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile $40/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on concrete $42/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $48/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $45/sq. ft. 
 

Occupied Units: 
Bath $62/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $57/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile $52/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $44/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $53/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $52/sq. ft. 

 
 
 
 

Tip Construction Inc. 
Ilya  Pribyshchuk 
ilyaptip@gmail.com 
814-504-4978 

Bath $29/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $22/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile Floor $10/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $9/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $14/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $13/sq. ft. 
Occupied Units:  Same 

Bath $31/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $24/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile Floor $11.50/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $10.50/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $16/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $15/sq. ft. 
Occupied   Units: Same 

Yes Checklist included. 
Addendum 
Acknowledged 

PalermoEx.Inc. 
Vincent Palermo 
vpalermo@palermoex.com  
814-572-6042 

Bath $24.75/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $17/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile Floor $8.50/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $6.50/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $9.50/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete 
$7.50/sq.ft. 
Occupied Units: Same 

Bath $25/sq. ft. 
Bath on Concrete $17.25/sq. ft. 
Vinyl Tile Floor $8.50/sq. ft. 
Vinyl on Concrete $6.50/sq. ft. 
Planking Floor $9.75/sq. ft. 
Planking on Concrete $7.50/sq. 
ft. 
Occupied Units: Same 
 

Yes Checklist included  
Addendum 
Acknowledged 

PWXPress 
Mary Miller 
bids@pwxpress.com 

 
   NO BID 

   

Cesar Garcia Construction 
Cesar Garcia 
Cesargarciaconstruction7@gmail.co
m  
423-716-8909 

 
 
   NO BID 

   

North America Procurement 
Council Inc. 
Eric Johnson 
sourcemanagement@napc.me  

 
   NO BID 

   

Dodge Data & Analytics 
Adam Bouman 
Dodge.bidding@construction.com 

 
   NO BID 
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Builders Exchange 
Amy Stewart 
astewart@bxohio.com 

 
   NO BID 

   

Constructconnect 
Morgan Stinson 
bidroom@coj.net   

 
   NO BID 

   

Onvia 
Sourcemanagement2@onvia.com  

   NO BID    

Prime Vendor 
Primevendor123@gmail.com 

   NO BID    
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