
HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE 
Bid Opening: October 16, 2023 – 10:00 a.m. 

FOR 
Gutter Cleaning at Various Locations 

 
Contractor 
 

Bid Amount 
    2023        /       2024 

Bid 
Bond 

Non-Coll. 
Affidavit 

Remarks Bid Submission & 
all items submitted 

Landella 
Larry Faul 
sixfauls@gmail.com 
814-779-3451 

 
 NO BID 

    

Miller Sewer & Drain, LLC 
Rebecca Phillips-Miller 
millersewer@yahoo.com 
814-899-7347 

 
  NO BID 

    

JMC Landscaping 
Juan Claudio 
jmcgreens@gmail.com 
814-572-5286 

 
  NO BID 

    

TIP Construction Inc. 
Ilya Pribyshchuk 
ilyaptip@gmail.com  
814-504-4978 

 
  NO BID 

    

Hoffman United, LLC 
Paul  Hoffman 
Paul.hoffman@hoffmanunited.com 
814-833-4364 

Amp#1   NO BID 
Amp#2 $47,950 / $48,950. 
Amp#3   NO BID 
Amp#4   NO BID 
EH          NO BID 
C.Ted   $  5,000 / $ 5,000. 
BH E      NO BID 
BH W     NO BID 
BH O      NO BID 
 

United 
Fire & 
Casualty 
Company 

 
  Yes 

Addendum 
acknowledged 

Checklist 
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Bauer Ventures 
Matthew Bauer 
matthewbauer@roadrunner.com 
814-434-2505 
 
          AWARDED 

Amp#1 $30,948.40/$32,495.83 
Amp#2 $38,068.98/$39,972.42 
Amp#3 $25,981.38/$27,280.45 
Amp#4 $12,365.47/$12,983.74 
EH        $8,892.02 / $ 9,336.62 
C. Ted  $ 1,945.13 / $ 2,042.39 
BH E    $    833.63 / $   875.31 
BH W   $    833.63 / $   875.31 
BH O    $    555.75 / $   583.54 

Western 
Surety 
Company 

   
  Yes 

Addendum 
acknowledged 

Checklist 
Included 

      
      
A-Team Pressure Washing 
Jake Francis 
Jakefrancis2004@2yahoo.com 
814-460-3997 
 
         AWARDED 

Amp#1   NO BID 
Amp#2 $28,000 / $28,000 
Amp#3   NO BID 
Amp#4 $10,660 / $10,660 
EH        $10,200 / $10,200 
C.Ted   $  2,200 / $  2,200 
BH E    $  1,000 / $  1,000 
BH W  $      900 / $     900 
BH O   $      320 / $     320 

The Ohio 
Casualty 
Insurance 
Company 

 
 
  Yes 

Addendum not 
Acknowledged 

Checklist 
Included 

      
Empire Snow Management, Inc. 
 

Amp#1 $48,300. / $48,300. 
Amp#2 $59,500. / $59,500. 
Amp#3 $38,975. / $38,975. 
Amp#4 $20,500. / $20,500. 
EH        $15,000. / $15,000. 
C.Ted   $13,900. / $13,900. 
BH E    $  6,000. / $  6,000. 
BH W  $  6,000. /  $  6,000. 
BH O   $  4,000. /  $  4,000. 

Great 
Lakes 
Insurance 
Services 
Group, 
LLC. 

 
  Yes 

Addendum  
Acknowledged 

Checklist  
Included 
 

Builders Exchange 
Allyson Daniels 
adaniels@bxhio.com 
 

 
     NO BID 

    

Kunco Landscape, Inc. 
Crystal Foster 
crystal@kunco.net 
814-899-1880 

 
     NO BID 
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Onvia 
Sourcemanagement2@onvia.com 
 

 
    NO BID 

    

PWXPress 
Mary Miller 
bids@pwxpress.com 
 

 
    NO BID 

    

ConstructConnect 
Morgan Stinson 
content@cnstructconnect.com  

 
     NO BID 

    

Prime Vendor 
Primevendor123@gmail.com 
 

 
     NO BID 
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