
HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE 
Bid Opening: July 13, 2023– 10:30 a.m. 

Trash, Rubbish and Garbage Collection 
Contractor 
 

Bid Amount 
 

1st  
Year 
P.U.M.* 

2nd 

Year 
P.U.M.* 

3rd 

Year 
P.U.M.* 

4th  
Year  
P.U.M. 

Bid Bond Affidavit Remarks 

Waste Management 
 
Terri Fischer 
Public Sector 
Representative 
 
625 Cherrington 
Parkway 
Moon Twp, PA 
15108 
 
PH 412-269-5379 
FAX 8662766381 
 
 
 
  AWARDED 

Harbor Home (217) 2901.29 3046.68 3198.58 3359.16 Liberty Mutual 
Insurance Co. 
 
10% of bid amounts 

Yes 
Signed  

  
Lake City Dwlgs (39) 1047.15 1099.80 1154.79 1212.51 
JEHGA (409) 5349.72 5615.57 5897.78 6192.26 
HH Annex (117) 1566.63 1643.85 1726.92 1813.50 
Scattered Sites (333) 7339.32 7705.62 8088.57 8494.83 
A. Priscaro (51) 842.52 884.85 928.71 975.12 
Eastbrook (48) 937.44 984.48 1033.44 1085.28 
Bird & Pearl (48) 792.96 832.80 874.08 917.76 
Pineview (66) 1136.52 1193.28 1253.34 1315.38 
CTDombrowski (32) 577.28 606.08 636.48 668.16 
Erie Heights (202) 3139.08 3296.64 3462.28 3633.98 
Schmid (187) 1782.11 1871.87 1965.37 2064.48 
Friendship (194) 1848.82 1941.94 2038.94 2141.76 
Ostrow (78) 578.76 607.62 638.04 670.02 
Curry/Schell (61) 419.07 439.81 462.38 484.95 
Better Housing 1138.28 1194.96 1254.76 1317.68 
QLLC Center 33.34 35.00 36.74 38.58 
        
Grand Total Years 1 & 2 $64,431.14    

      
Pro Waste Services 
Alex Pol 
Alex.pol@prowasteinc.c
om  
814-434-3074 

 
      NO BID 

    

sourcemanagement@napc.me – Eric Johnson NO BID    
     
bids@pwpress.com – Mary Miller  NO BID    
sourcemanagement2@onvia.com  NO BID    
     
Content@constructconnect.com  NO BID    
sourcemanagement@deltek.com  NO BID    
astewart@bxohio.com  NO BID    
Primevendor123@gmail.com  NO BID    



      
      
         

 


