

**HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE**  
**Bid Opening: October 18, 2021 – 10:30 a.m.**  
**FOR**  
**Floor Replacement at Various Locations**

<b>Contractor</b>	<b>Bid Amount</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>Affidavit</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Bid Submission &amp; all items submitted</b>																					
<b>TIP Construction</b> Ilya Pribyshchuk <a href="mailto:ilya@tipmodeling.com">ilya@tipmodeling.com</a> 814-504-4978	NO BID																									
<b>Konkol Construction</b> Randy Konkol <a href="mailto:konkolconstruction@yahoo.com">konkolconstruction@yahoo.com</a> 814-450-5846  <b>AWARDED</b>	<table style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th></th> <th style="text-align: center;">2022</th> <th style="text-align: center;">2023</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Bath Fl.</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$25.00</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$26.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Bath on conc.</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$17.00</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$18.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Vinyl Tile</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 7.90</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 9.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Vinyl Tile/conc.</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 5.90</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 7.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Planking</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 9.50</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$10.00</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Planking/conc.</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 7.50</td> <td style="text-align: right;">\$ 8.00</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>		2022	2023	Bath Fl.	\$25.00	\$26.00	Bath on conc.	\$17.00	\$18.00	Vinyl Tile	\$ 7.90	\$ 9.00	Vinyl Tile/conc.	\$ 5.90	\$ 7.00	Planking	\$ 9.50	\$10.00	Planking/conc.	\$ 7.50	\$ 8.00		Yes	Acknowledged 2 Addendums	Yes
	2022	2023																								
Bath Fl.	\$25.00	\$26.00																								
Bath on conc.	\$17.00	\$18.00																								
Vinyl Tile	\$ 7.90	\$ 9.00																								
Vinyl Tile/conc.	\$ 5.90	\$ 7.00																								
Planking	\$ 9.50	\$10.00																								
Planking/conc.	\$ 7.50	\$ 8.00																								
<b>DRS of Erie</b> Ross Edmiston <a href="mailto:rosse@drsoferie.com">rosse@drsoferie.com</a> 814-969-8956	NO BID																									
<b>Construction Journal</b> Pamela Exton <a href="mailto:bids@constructionjournal.com">bids@constructionjournal.com</a>	NO BID																									
<b>Jack Johnson</b> <a href="mailto:bnlconstruction@gmx.com">bnlconstruction@gmx.com</a> 412-701-7866	NO BID																									
<b>EL and K Unlimited LLC</b> Leesa Buck <a href="mailto:elandkunlimited@yahoo.com">elandkunlimited@yahoo.com</a> 814-384-7278	NO BID																									

<b>The Blue Book Network</b> Megan Locascio <a href="mailto:mlocascio@mail.thebluebook.com">mlocascio@mail.thebluebook.com</a>	NO BID				
<b>Builders Exchange, Inc.</b> Clair Khalid ckhalid@bxohio.com	NO BID				
<b>BEST WEST</b> Jamie Bowman <a href="mailto:info@bxstier.com">info@bxstier.com</a>	NO BID				
<b>Construct Connect</b> Morgan Stinson <a href="mailto:content@constructconnect.com">content@constructconnect.com</a>	NO BID				

