

HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE

Bid Opening: Monday, May 17, 2021 – 10:30 a.m.

FOR

**Annual Physical Inspection of 2,216 Housing Units,
Administration Buildings & Centers**

Contractor	Bid Amount	Affidavit	Remarks
U. S. Inspection Group, Inc. Ken Pilbin, President P. O. Box 2838 Crossville, TN 38557 PH 866-863-8744 FAX 866-573-3280 jemery@usinspectiongroup.com	\$21,908.70 \$9.90/unit HH- \$4,197.60 LCD-\$3,247.20 JEHGA-\$4,811.40 SS - \$1,415.70 Schmid-\$1,910.70 FA - \$1,980.00 Ostrow-\$792.00 EH-\$2,079.00. Domb.-\$336.60 Curry/Schell-\$623.70 BH Old-\$118.80 BH East-\$198.00 BH West-\$198.00	Yes	ECS Services, LLC
American Property Consultants, Inc. Dennis DiBello, Point of Contact apcdennis@comcast.net 5901 Hillside Road Saint Leonard, MD 20685-2552 800-272-7134 Fax: 410-586-1963 Misty Behnke; apcmisty@comcast.net 1-800-2722-71334	No Bid		

HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF ERIE

Bid Opening: Monday, May 17, 2021 – 10:30 a.m.

FOR

**Annual Physical Inspection of 2,216 Housing Units,
Administration Buildings & Centers**

PAGE 2

Contractor	Bid Amount	Affidavit	Remarks
<p>The Inspection Group, Inc. Mr. Saul Himmelstein Matt LaVrar, Vice Pres.-Inspection matt@TheinspectionGroup.com PO Box 3180 Westerville, Ohio 43086-3180</p>	<p align="center">No Bid</p>		
<p>McCright and Associates annb@mccright.com Ann Billingsley Phone: 423-267-1300</p>	<p>\$35,575.00 \$12.50/unit HH-\$7237.50 LCD \$7,112.50 JEHGA-\$7,462.50 SS-\$2,575.00 Schmid-\$2,425.00 FA-\$2,512.50 Ostrow-\$1,037.50 EH-\$3,125.00. Domb.-\$600.00 Curry/Schell-\$800.00 BH Old-\$162.50 BH East-\$262.50 BH West-\$262.50</p>	<p align="center">Yes</p>	<p>McGriff Insurance Services</p>

Roth LLC Architect & Planners Dale Roth Phone: 814-528-5573	No Bid		
Calvin Giordano & Associates, Inc. A subsidiary of SafeBuilt 1800 Eller Drive, Suite 600 Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33316 954-921-7781 Jessica Koehler procurement@cgasolutions.com	No Bid		
SafeBuilt 3755 Precision Drive, suite 140 Loveland, CO 80538 Tasha Qualls	No Bid		
Erica France efrance@constructionjournal.com	No Bid		
svcagency@onvia.com	No Bid		